



**DEMOLITION AND REMOVAL OF FOUR CITY STRUCTURES**

ITB-019-2011

Opened 5/12/2011 @ 11:15 A.M.

Awarded by Council on: \_\_\_\_\_

*/**Hillsite Construction 7445 SW 83rd Place Ocala, FL 34476 (352) 207-6513	**Norton Home Improvement dba Bubba's Site Prep 3367 S US Hwy 441, #101 Lake City, FL 32025	<b>PAW Materials Inc.</b> <b>6640 State Road 52</b> <b>Hudson, FL 34667</b> <b>(727) 862-5956</b>	*CES Inc. PO Box 1299 Crystal Springs, FL 33524 (813) 783-1688
--	--	--	---

ITEM I: Lake City Waterworks (Clements Place)

\$43,620.00	\$59,904.00	<b>\$44,500.00</b>	\$136,993.00
-------------	-------------	--------------------	--------------

ITEM II: Putnam Street WTP (Putnam Street)

\$74,640.00	\$149,956.00	<b>\$27,400.00</b>	\$162,450.00
-------------	--------------	--------------------	--------------

ITEM III: Melton-Bishop WTP (Sandia Way)

\$14,390.00	\$6,896.00	<b>\$2,500.00</b>	\$7,450.00
-------------	------------	-------------------	------------

ITEM IV: Clayton-Smith WTP (Faye Lane)

\$6,260.00	\$5,975.00	<b>\$2,500.00</b>	\$6,900.00
------------	------------	-------------------	------------

**25% discount if awarded all four sites  
Total \$57,675.00**

*Cross Construction Svcs 25221 Wesley Chapel Blvd. Lutz, FL 33559 (813) 907-1013	Samsula Waste, Inc. 363 S SR 415 New Smyrna Beach, FL 32168 (386) 423-6769	Curt's Construction Inc. 519 NW Crawford Ct. White Springs, FL 32096 (386) 758-1935	*Eager Contracting Inc. PO Box 222 Williston, FL 32696 (352) 528-2949
---	---	--	--

ITEM I: Lake City Waterworks (Clements Place)

\$97,950.00	\$91,395.00	\$112,000.00	no bid
-------------	-------------	--------------	--------

ITEM II: Putnam Street WTP (Putnam Street)

\$118,600.00	\$143,829.00	\$228,000.00	no bid
--------------	--------------	--------------	--------

ITEM III: Melton-Bishop WTP (Sandia Way)

\$5,000.00	\$22,289.00	\$19,750.00	\$11,900.00
------------	-------------	-------------	-------------

ITEM IV: Clayton-Smith WTP (Faye Lane)

\$6,070.00	\$21,424.00	\$12,500.00	\$9,500.00
------------	-------------	-------------	------------

**Recommendation: PAW Materials Inc.**

\* Did not acknowledge any/all addendums

\*\*Did not submit work plan



**DEMOLITION AND REMOVAL OF FOUR CITY STRUCTURES**

ITB-019-2011

Opened 5/12/2011 @ 11:15 A.M.

Tropical Recycling Inc. PO Box 115 Micanopy, FL 32667 (352) 332-3885	*Andrews Paving Inc. 6327 NW 123rd Place Gainesville, FL 32653 (386) 462-1115	**Don's Septic & Fill Inc. PO Box 6014 Live Oak, FL 32064 (386) 364-4432	*A & A Trucking & Excavating 2080 NW 35th St. Ocala, FL 34475 (352) 351-2042
---	--	---	---

ITEM I: Lake City Waterworks (Clements Place)

no bid	\$57,018.00	\$62,000.00	\$46,294.00
--------	-------------	-------------	-------------

ITEM II: Putnam Street WTP (Putnam Street)

no bid	\$80,368.00	\$49,500.00	\$62,994.00
--------	-------------	-------------	-------------

ITEM III: Melton-Bishop WTP (Sandia Way)

\$3,800.00	\$9,232.00	\$4,490.00	\$0.00
------------	------------	------------	--------

ITEM IV: Clayton-Smith WTP (Faye Lane)

\$3,400.00	\$8,146.00	\$4,490.00	\$0.00
------------	------------	------------	--------

Did not provide copy of license

Item #3 & #4 will be no charge.  
If awarded all four sites, will credit \$240,000  
Total \$106,888.

*Done Right LLC PO Box 1083 Crystal River, FL 34423 (352) 586-5601
---

ITEM I: Lake City Waterworks (Clements Place)

\$58,400.00
-------------

ITEM II: Putnam Street WTP (Putnam Street)

\$49,992.00
-------------

ITEM III: Melton-Bishop WTP (Sandia Way)

\$1,435.00
------------

ITEM IV: Clayton-Smith WTP (Faye Lane)

\$1,260.00
------------

\* Did not acknowledge any/all addendums

\*\*Did not submit work plan